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Consultant 

Paul Marks 
Paul Marks is the Founder and Managing Director of Change Works Ltd. He is also 
the Communication Officer for the International Coach Federation (ICF) Bangkok, 
Thailand. 
 
Paul is educated to a Master’s Degree in Education and has extensive experience in cross 
cultural business communications. Paul has been living and working in Thailand for over 16 
years. Training and coaching executives from over 35 countries, Paul understands the 
secrets of building, maintaining and enhancing cross-cultural relationships in business 
practices. 

www.mentisglobal.com 

Business Experience   
 
As a leading executive coach, Paul’s method to coaching executives is bases upon cutting 
edge strategies that have been developed through neuroscience research. Paul is a certified 
Brain-based Coach (BBC) from the Institute of Neuro-Leadership. He is also a certified 
Professional Coach and Mentor (CCMP) and holds an advanced certificate in coaching and 
mentoring plus a Certificate in performance coaching which is accredited and recognised by 
the International Coaching Federation (ICF) -the world’s leading coaching professional body.  
 
Paul is a certified practitioner and trainer of the MBTi personality type assessment. Paul has 
a wealth of experience in education, sales, communications, change management, 
negotiations, and stress management. Paul carries out training and delivers courses and 
coaching to client requirements in the fields of Leadership, Personal excellence and The 
Success Principles, Cross cultural business relationships, Corporate cross cultural team 
building, Communication skills, Presentation skills, Assertiveness skills, Negotiation skills, 
Stress management, Leadership and Business networking.  Paul has a passion for helping 
others succeed and become successful.  
 
Paul specialises in “Real World” training, where the focus is firmly on finding practical 
solutions that work for his clients. Paul’s energetic and vibrant personality makes him an 
enjoyable and entertaining trainer and coach that inspires and motivates all who attend his 
workshops. He has been personally trained and certified by Dr. Jack Canfield as a world-
class trainer for The Success Principles and Personal Excellence program. In addition to 
Paul’s professional qualifications, Paul is a practitioner of NeuroLinguistic Programming 
(NLP) and Positive Psychology. 
 
Paul has worked with clients ranging from major multi-national corporations, UN 
Organisations, Embassies, Universities, Government Ministries, to local SMEs, and 
individuals that have a desire to develop and succeed. 


